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Assistant, Associate, or Full Professor  

Center for Health System Improvement 
University of Tennessee Health Science Center 

Memphis, Tennessee 
 
We are seeking a clinician-investigator with a passion for patient-centered research to join a growing 
and dynamic team of faculty in the Center for Health System Improvement. The Center leads the 
region-wide Diabetes Wellness and Prevention Coalition Registry and works in collaboration with 
major health systems and community health centers throughout the Mid-South to improve care for 
vulnerable populations. 
 
The clinician-investigator will care for patients, train and supervise clinical trainees and health policy 
and outcomes research PhD candidates, and conduct pragmatic clinical and health services research. 
Candidates should have a strong interest in one or more of these areas: patient-centered outcomes 
research; health services; quality improvement; comparative effectiveness; health care delivery; health 
information technology; disparities; and improving care for patients with obesity, diabetes, or other 
chronic diseases. 
 
This full-time faculty position is available at the assistant, associate, or full professor level with a tenure-
track option. The appointment will be in The University of Tennessee Health Science Center, College 
of Medicine, Division of General Internal Medicine. Successful candidates will hold an M.D. with an 
additional M.P.H., Ph.D., or equivalent degree; demonstrated scientific accomplishment; excellent oral 
and written communication skills; and an ability to acquire sustained, external, investigator-initiated 
funding. Preference will be given to applicants who have conducted scholarly work in health services 
and/or pragmatic clinical research with practical implications for clinical practice and/or population 
health, and to candidates who can lead multidisciplinary research teams to develop and test 
interventions to improve health systems serving vulnerable populations. 
 
Confidential review of materials will begin immediately and will continue until the appointment is 
made. 
 
Submit letters of nomination, applications (with a letter of interest, a complete CV, and a list of three 
references), or inquiries to: Dr. Jim Bailey, Professor & Director, Center for Health System 
Improvement, College of Medicine, University of Tennessee Health Science Center, 956 Court 
Avenue, Memphis, TN 38163; phone: 901-448-2475; email: jeb@uthsc.edu or chsi@uthsc.edu. 
 
 
 
The University of Tennessee is an EEO/AA/Title VI/Title IX/Section 504/ADA/ADEA institution in the 
provision of its education and employment programs and services. 


